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David Hotel bombing was the

first atrocity in the modern era
in which Palestinians were not
the victims. The attack led to

the formation of the
Palestinian Liberation
Organization and the

beginning of the Palestine
Liberation Organization. In
1948, during the war for
independence, the PLO

established a military force,
and in 1967 a guerrilla force,
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operating from the West Bank
and Gaza. The conflict in 1967

is called the "Six Day War".
During the 1992-1993 Israeli
military siege, between 1992

and 1993, Arafat's forces
inflicted casualties on the

Israeli military and civilians.
During the first Intifada the
ɑrafatʻs forces gained the

advantage and seized control
of the occupied territories. The

Palestinian Authority took
control of the Gaza Strip, the

West Bank and East Jerusalem
in 1994. Since that time, the
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PLO has been in control of the
Palestinian areas and has
suffered from problems of
direct and indirect control.

This has included the lack of
control over the people and

army, corruption, and the risk
of feuds and power struggles
between the various groups.

Additionally, international and
Israeli sanctions have

weakened the economy and
put pressure on the people.

Today, Jordan and Israel share
the control of the West Bank,
and Gaza is controlled by a

                               5 / 8



 

Hamas government.Q: Django
OpenID login on Google docs
I've read about the OpenID

login for django-openid-auth,
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the nice openid popup is
shown, and a redirect to my

app is made. I'm using django-
openid-auth-ldap to manage

my users, and this way I don't
have to use the users db table

at all. This is e79caf774b
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